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AIRFRAME
Registration N900HD

Serial Number 103

Total Hours


Total Landings


7645


3247


ENGINES
 Left Engine Center Engine Right Engine

Model Garrett TFE731-60-1C

Serial Number(s) P112422 P112423 P112424 

Total Hours


Total Cycles


APU

7298


3125

7561


3219

7561


3219

Model Honeywell GTCP 36-150F


Serial Number P-420 


Total Hours
 4645

Current July 23, 2024

Enrolled on Engine MSP Gold Program

Enrolled on APU MSP Gold Program

AVIONICS

- Honeywell Primus Elite w/5-Tube EFIS upgrade with 

Synthetic Vision and Charts 


- DU 875 Elite II New version 830 FMS Mark 2 CDU 


- FANS 1A 	 


- Flight Dynamics HGS-2860 HUD-Cat IIIA


- Triple Honeywell NZ-2000 FMS, touchscreens with 6.1 
upgrades


- Dual Collins VHF-422C Comms


- Dual Collins VIR-432 Navs


- Dual Collins ADF-462


- Dual Collins DME-442


- Dual Collins TDR-94D Mode S Transponders


- Dual Collins HF-9000


- Coltech CSD-714 SELCAL (2 Ch.)


- Honeywell Primus 880 Weather Radar


- Dual Honeywell AA-300 Radio Alts


- Honeywell AP/Auto-throttles


- Dual Honeywell GPS


- Triple Laseref IV IRS


- Collins TCAS 4000 (Ch. 7)


- Mk V EGPWS


- Honeywell SSCVR, Honeywell SSFDR-57 parameters


- Socata ELT 97-406 (406 MHz) ELT


- SATAFIS
The information contained herein does not constitute an offer, commitment, 
representation, guarantee or warranty of any kind, and is subject to change 
without prior notice. This information has been provided in good faith. Verification 
of specifications is the responsibility of the buyer. Aircraft is subject to prior sale or 
withdrawal from the market. Photo credits to Aeon Aviation Photography.



2002 Falcon 900EX
INTERIOR

Twelve (12) passenger interior consisting of a forward four (4) place club, mid 
cabin four (4) place dining group opposite a credenza, and an aft three (3) place 
divan opposite an executive work station. 


Chatham leather seats in Fallow (tan), Pindler & Pindler Muslim divan in Mink 
(dark brown), tan carpeting, Chestnut Burl Birdseye Maple cabinetry, 24K Satin 
Gold hardware, Tapis Corporation leather upper sidewalls in Ostrich (light beige), 
Edelman leather lower sidewalls in Ore (dark brown) & Pollack Secret Garden 
sidewall & lavatory accents in Serpia. 


Forward full service 36” galley has a TIA automatic coffee maker, two (2) TIA 
high temperature ovens, ice chest, cold storage chest, TIA Wavejet microwave, & 
storage.


Forward and aft lavatories.


EXTERIOR

Allover white with red and blue stripping.


COMMUNICATIONS / ENTERTAINMENT

- Collins SAT-6000 Aero H+ SATCOM


- GoGo WIFI Internet


- Airshow Genesys, multi region DVD, 10 disk CD player, VCR, one 18” and one 
15” bulkhead mounted monitor. Three (3) Rosen 5.6” LCD plug-in monitors and 
stereo speakers.


Additional Notes

- Increased MTOW SB                         - High Altitude Landing SB 


- CAMP                                              - Teleflex Recognition Light System

MAINTENANCE

12 Month Inspection - Due October 24, 2024


24 Month / 1600 HR Inspection - Due December 10, 2024


36 Month / 2400 HR Inspection - Due October 25, 2026


1B Inspection - Due at 9,181.3 Hrs


2B Inspection - Due at 9,080.3 Hrs


3B Inspection - Due at 9,080.3 Hrs


1C/2C Inspection - Due December 10, 2026


For more maintenance information:


Status Report


24 Month Due List


AD/SB Master List

The information contained herein does not constitute an offer, commitment, 
representation, guarantee or warranty of any kind, and is subject to change 
without prior notice. This information has been provided in good faith. Verification 
of specifications is the responsibility of the buyer. Aircraft is subject to prior sale or 
withdrawal from the market. Photo credits to Aeon Aviation Photography.Brad Wollen | +1 (206) 793-3750 |  bwollen@zone5jets.com
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https://drive.google.com/open?id=1mcdeyOC_33Hm48K3rJRYJ4qkc93kf8Wv&usp=drive_fs
https://drive.google.com/open?id=1n-3F6uVbedmIhBTlS3hLC30PIBa3LKyI&usp=drive_fs
https://drive.google.com/open?id=1mtT39OpOxJDivVkJqAFimwtuFHrhwmv-&usp=drive_fs
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